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Cook Islands are a self-governing island state in free association with New Zealand. It comprises a
volcanic archipelago of 15 islands with a total land area of 237 square kilometers spread over two
million square kilometers of South Paci�c Ocean. The southern islands, which account for 90% of the
land area, are rugged terrain formed by recent volcanic activity, with Rarotonga being the most
mountainous of the group of islands. The northern islands are coral atolls created over volcanoes, with
outer reefs surrounding a lagoon.

Demographics

As of July 2020 estimates, 8,574 people live on the Islands. Of them, 81.3% are Polynesian Cook Island
Maori.The culture diversity of the Cook Islands is re�ected in a variety of the languages used in the
region besides English. The of�cial language is Cook Islands Maori, otherwise known as ‘Rarotongan’,
and Pukapukan. Dialects of Cook Islands Maori also include Penrhyn, Rakahanga-Manihiki, the
Ngaputoru dialect of Atiu, Mitiaro, and Mauke, the Aitutaki dialect and the Mangaian dialect. The major
religion is Christianity.

The culture of the area is very diverse. The Cook Islands’ music is distinguished by ukuleles and strong
percussion. Each island has its own unique dances, which are taught to children from an early age. The
Maori ura, a traditional dance usually performed by a female who uses her body movements to convey a
story, is one of the Cook Islands’ most popular traditional dances.

History

The Cook Islands were �rst settled around 1000 AD by Polynesian travellers from the Society and
Marquesas islands (now known as French Polynesia), as part of the great voyages. In 1595, the �rst
European to sight the island of Pukapuka was a Spaniard named Alvaro de Mendana de Neira. In 1773,
Captain James Cook explored the islands and the islands were named Hervey Islands. Fifty years later,
the Russian–Baltic German Admiral Adam Johann von Krusenstern published the Atlas de l’Ocean
Paci�que, in which the islands were renamed as the Cook Islands in honour of Captain Cook. The Cook
Islands were proclaimed a British protectorate and a single federal parliament was established in 1888.
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The Cook Islands are a constitutional monarchy with a parliamentary representative democracy. The
Cook Islands is a self-governing territory in free association with New Zealand, with complete control
over its internal affairs. In consultation with the Cook Islands, New Zealand retains authority for external
affairs and defense. The Cook Islands has a legal system which is independent in every respect from that
of the State of New Zealand. The judiciary of the Cook Islands is a system of courts that interprets and
applies the laws of the Cook Islands. The judiciary has three levels: the Judicial Committee of the Privy
Council serves as a �nal court of appeal. The Cook Islands Court of Appeal hears appeals from the High
Court. The High Court of the Cook Islands deals with criminal and civil cases, as well as land cases under
customary law. Minor crimes are heard in the High Court by Justices of the Peace.

Economy

The Cook Islands’ economy centers on tourism, accounting for 70% of gross domestic products of the
state. Tourism-related demand accounts for 80% of energy consumption, which creates more
employment opportunities for the citizens. Its territory’s natural assets include white sand beaches, blue
lagoons, and volcanic mountains. From 2005 to 2015, it saw an increase of 42% of travelers visiting the
Cook Islands from 88,000 travelers in 2005 to 125,000 travelers in 2015. Agriculture is the other key
source revenue, which together with �shing accounts for 3% of the GDP in 2017. This sector employs
over one-quarter of the working population and provides the economic base with major exports of copra
and citrus fruit. Other key exports include black pearl exports, the sale of �shing licenses to foreign
�eets, and offshore �nance.

Trade

In 2019, Cook Islands exported $30.3 million worth of goods, making it the world’s number 205
exporter. The key recent exports included non-�llet frozen �sh ($11.8 million), recreational boats ($6.99
million), �sh �llets ($4.97 million), and precious metal scraps ($1.97 million). These products were
mainly exported to Japan ($11.3 million), Thailand ($6.24 million), France ($5.21 million), China ($1.2
million), and Spain ($1.16 million). Cook Islands exports decreased by $2.83 million in the last �ve
years, from $33.1 million in 2014 to $30.3 million in 2019. Black pearls are also the Cook Islands
leading export.

Legal System and Government
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Real estate, mostly for tourist resorts, lounges, apartments, and bungalows, is a major area of
opportunity for investment as the government is hoping to increase tourism in the Cook Islands. Another
lucrative investment opportunity is in the redevelopment and quality processing of black pearl
consumer goods; as the raw products are native to the islands, local businesses are seeking joint
venture programs to enhance the quality of the products. Sustainable ecotourism and scuba diving are
also an area of investment interest.

Sources

https://www.dfat.gov.au/geo/cook-islands/Pages/cook-islands

https://www.cia.gov/the-world-factbook/countries/cook-islands/

https://www.dfat.gov.au/sites/default/�les/cook.pdf

https://www.bbc.com/news/world-asia-paci�c-16495238

https://www.adb.org/sites/default/�les/publication/430171/tourism-growth-paci�c.pdf

http://www.mfem.gov.ck/statistics/134-economic-statistics/national-accounts

http://www.nzlii.org/nz/journals/NZYbkIntLaw/2008/10.html

https://www.indexmundi.com/cook_islands/demographics_pro�le.html

https://www.paci�ctradeinvest.com/investments#!/country/1565

Investment Opportunities
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